HP03-2026CHM

ITEMS NOT AWARDED

Item (ltem Specification Therapeutic Unit as Advertised |Published ]litem Status
No Class Number Estimate
1 Clip, tubal occlusion, mechanical locking device, X- Pair 26 178 No Bid on HP03-2026CHM
ray detectable, sterile unit Procure on quotation
2 Clomifene 50mg tablet; 5 tablets Procurement Pack of 5 tablets 11692 No Bid on HP03-2026CHM
Class 1 Procurement Class 1
Procure on quotation
3 Clomifene 50mg tablet; 10 tablets Procurement Pack of 10 tablets 5 846 No Bid on HP03-2026CHM
Class 1 Procurement Class 1
Procure on quotation
16 Desogestrel and Ethinylestradiol 0.150/0.03mg (21) [Class 2 Pack of 28 tablets 7 088 100 Non-Award on HP03-2026CHM
and inert (7) tablet; 28 tablets Class 2 Award
Awarded to item 27
7 Drospirenone and Ethinylestradiol 3/0.03mg (21) and |Class 2 Pack of 28 tablets 7 088 100 Non-Award on HP03-2026CHM
inert (7) tablet; 28 tablets Class 2 Award
Awarded to item 27
10 Estradiol 25mcg release per 24 hours transdermal Class 5 Pack of 8 transdermal |77 120 No Bid on HP03-2026CHM
patch; 8 transdermal patches patches Class 5 Award
Awarded to item 8
1 Estradiol 75mcg release per 24 hours transdermal Class 6 Pack of 8 transdermal |69 290 No Bid on HP03-2026CHM
patch; 8 transdermal patches patches Class 6 Award
Awarded to item 9
13 Estradiol and Norethisterone 1/0 (16) and 1/1mg (12) [Class 7 Pack of 28 tablets 1800 No Bid on HP03-2026CHM
tablet; 28 tablets, calendar pack Class 7 Award
Awarded to item 12
16 Estradiol and Norethisterone 0.62/2.7mg (release per [Class 3 Pack of 8 transdermal |34 110 No Bid on HP03-2026CHM
24 hours estradiol 50mcg, norethisterone 140mcg) patches Class 3 Award
transdermal patch; 8 transdermal patches Awarded to item 14
17 Estradiol and Norethisterone 3.2/11.2mg transdermal |Class 4 Pack of 8 transdermal |36 870 No Bid on HP03-2026CHM
patch (release per 24 hours estradiol 50mcg, patches Class 4 Award
norethisterone 170mcg); 8 transdermal patches Awarded to item 15
18 Estrogens Conjugated 0.3mg tablet; 28 tablets Pack of 28 tablets 91 950 Non-Award on HP03-2026CHM
Procure on quotation
Bidder declined award
19 Estrogens Conjugated 0.625mg tablet; 28 tablets Pack of 28 tablets 404 568 Non-Award on HP03-2026CHM
Procure on quotation
Bidder declined award
20 Estrogens Conjugated and Medroxyprogesterone Pack of 28 tablets 1040 No Bid on HP03-2026CHM
0.625/5mg tablet; 28 tablets Procure on quotation
21 Gestodene and Ethinylestradiol 0.075/0.03mg (21) Class 2 Pack of 28 tablets 7 088 100 Non-Award on HP03-2026CHM
and inert (7) tablet; 28 tablets Class 2 Award
Awarded to item 27
23 Intra-uterine system containing, Levonorgestrel Class 1 Each 73 530 Non-Award on HP03-2026CHM
19,6mg, releasing Levonorgestrel over 5 years. Class 1 Award
Sterile, individually packed unit containing inserter. T- Awarded to item 24
body with removal threads in sealed sterilisation
pouch; Unit: Each
25 Levonorgestrel 0.03mg tablet; 28 tablets, calendar Pack of 28 tablets 2410 740 Non-Award on HP03-2026 CHM
pack Non-Compliant Bid(s)
Procure on quotation
28 Levonorgestrel and Ethinylestradiol triphasic, Pack of 28 tablets 10218 977 JNon-Award on HP03-2026CHM
0.05/0.03mg (6); 0.075/0.04mg (5); 0.125/0.03mg Non-Compliant Bid(s)
(10) and inert (7) tablet; 28 tablets, calendar pack Procure on quotation
32 Medroxyprogesterone Acetate, 104mg / 0.65mL Each 2130930 Non-Award on HP03-2026CHM
Suspension for Subcutaneous (SC) Injection , Single- Non-Compliant Bid(s)
dose disposable injector Procure on quotation
38 Norethisterone and Estradiol 0/2mg (10); 1/2mg (10) |Class 8 Pack of 28 tablets 15 040 No Bid on HP03-2026CHM
and 0/1mg (6) tablet; 28 tablets, calendar pack Class 8
Procure on quotation
39 Norgestrel and Estradiol valerate 0/2mg (11); Class 8 Pack of 28 tablets 15 040 No Bid on HP03-2026CHM
2/0,5mg (10) and inert (7) tablet; 28 tablets, calendar Class 8
pack Procure on quotation
40 Norgestrel and Ethinylestradiol monophasic Pack of 28 tablets 1789 780 No Bid on HP03-2026CHM
0.5/0.05mg (21) and inert (7) tablet; 28 tablets, Procure on quotation
calendar pack
42 Ring, fallopian tube, manufactured from One guide with every (26 218 Non-Award on HP03-2026CHM
dimethylpolysiloxane (silastic) containing two fallopian 50 Pairs Non-Compliant Bid(s)
ring bands and one dilator. Sterile and radio-opaque; Procure on quotation
one guide must be supplied with every 50 pairs
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